BENZIE COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2022 MATERIAL BID TABS 2/18/22

Single beveled grader blades Primary award
St Regis Culv Wear Parts
S 38,664.00 | S 55,713.60
3/4" X 8" X 72" Single bevel grader blades
40,000 pound load - per blade/360 blades total S 107.40| S 154.76
20,000 pound load - per blade S 117.00( S 154.76
10,000 pound load - per blade S 127.20| S 154.76
Curved carbide grader blades Primary award
Truck/Trailer Wear Parts St Regis Culvert
75 -3/4" X 8" X 72" blades - per blade S 284.00 | $ 378.27 | $ 386.76
Total for 75 blades: $ 21,300.00 | $ 28,370.25 | S 29,007.00
Curved Grader Cutting Blades Primary award
Truck/Trailer St Regis Culv
3/4" X 6" X 84" single bevel - 40 blades S 5,680.00 | $ 5,368.00
3/4" X 6" X 72" serrated - 12 blades S 1,872.00 | S 2,511.84
Wing blade mold board wear shoes - 40 shoes S 7,800.00 No bid
9'X 8" X 5/8" reverse curve wing - 20 blades S 3,220.00 No bid
Total order:| $  18,572.00
State Catch Basin Cleaning Primary award
Greenscape CSB Industries | Rogue Industrial
Catch basin cleaning - price is for 200+ each S 65.00 | S 62.50 | S 67.50
Emergency cleanout - hourly S 285.00 | S 250.00 | $ 95.00
County Catch Basin Cleaning Primary award
Greenscape | CSB Industries | Rogue Industrial
Catch basin cleaning - hourly S 260.00 | S 250.00 | $ 150.00
Emergency cleanout - hourly S 285.00 | S 275.00 | $ 230.00
Rip Rap Stone Accept all bids
price per ton Specification Team Elmers Kasson S&G Al's Excavating
Stone Products
Small 4"-8" picked up at your pit No bid S 36.50 [ S 30.00 | $ 41.00
Small 4"-8" delivered to Honor Pit No bid S 70.50 | S 3525 | $ 70.00
Plain 8"-16" picked up at your pit S 40.00 | S 38.75| S 4500 | $ 45.00
Plain 8"-16" delivered to Honor Pit S 68.00 | S 7275 | S 50.25 | $ 70.00
Heavy 16" min picked up at your pit S 45.00 | $ 43.25 [ S 60.00 No bid
Heavy 16" min delivered to Honor Pit S 72.50 | S 77.25 | S 65.25 No bid
36" - 48" picked up at your pit S 55.00 | S 55.05 No bid No bid
36"- 48" delivered to Honor Pit S 79.50 | S 90.00 No bid No bid
Pavement Markings Primary award
MPM PK Contracting
Mobilization (4 trips maximum) per trip: S 250.00 | S 100.00
Waterborne paint: Early season Yellow per foot: S 0.06 | S 0.052
Waterborne paint: Early season White per foot: S 0.06 | S 0.050
Waterborne paint: Late season Yellow per foot: S 0.07 | S 0.052
Waterborne paint: Late season White per foot: S 0.07 S 0.050
Rumble strips price per lineal foot S 750 | $ 7.50
Snowmobile crossings price per sq. foot No bid S 7.50
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BENZIE COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2022 MATERIAL BID TABS 2/18/22

Guardrail

Accept both bids

Jensen Bridge &| Nationwide
Supply Control Group
Guardrail Approach Terminal, Type 1B (ea) S 2,264.29 | S 3,000.00
Guardrail Approach Terminal, Fleat (ea) S 2,428.57 | S 3,000.00
Guardrail, Backed, Detail G-2 S 2,770.01 | $ 2,800.00
Guardrail, Curved, Type B (ft) S 26.67 | S 40.00
Guardrail, Departing Terminal, Type B (ea) S 616.67 | S 900.00
Beam Guardrail, Type B (6'Steel Posts) (ft) S 1350 | $ 35.00
Beam Guardrail, Type B (8' Steel Posts) (ft) S 14.09 | S 55.00
Guardrail Reflectors (ea) S 480 | S 8.00
Plastic blocks S 7.14 | S 9.00
SRT 350 Assembly S 2,264.29 | S 3,000.00
Emulsion Award bid
Bit-Mat
0-3,000 gallons HFRS - 2 - per gallon S 3.10
3,000-6,000 gallons HFRS - 2 per gallon S 2.85
0-3,000 gallons HFRS - 2 Alt for patcher S 3.10
3,000-6,000 gallons HFRS - 2 Alt for patcher S 2.85 | Ae-90
Brine Award bid
Liquid Calcium Michigan D & J Bowen
Chloride Cloride Dust Control Inc. G-L Chloride
26% Calcium Chloride - per gallon No bid No bid S 0.31 No Bid
Per mile (2,500 gallons) S 775.00
32% Calcium Chloride S 0.624 No bid No bid S 0.54
Per mile (2,500 gallons) S 1,560.00 S 1,350.00
38% Calcium Chloride S 0.724 No bid No bid ) 0.58
Per mile (2,500 gallons) S 1,810.00 S 1,450.00
Alternate bids
42% Calcium Chloride No bid No bid No bid S 0.642
Per mile (2,500 gallons) S 1,605.00
32% winter use brine storage in Honor Pit S 0.594 No bid No bid S 0.505
Alternative use winter brine storage Honor Pit No bid S 0.245 | S 025 (S 1.031
Mineral well Mineral well 32% with boost
1/4" Natural crushed, washed stone Accept all bids - this commodity
AJ's Excavating | Team Elmers Verplank
Price per ton picked up at your pit S 29.00 | S 29.50 No bid
Price per ton delivered to Honor Pit S 70.00 | S 36.50 | S 57.00
250 AWI CS-T trap rock
Produce 15,000 yds 23A @ Thompson Pit
Team Elmers
Price: S 119,250.00
$7.95/yard
Produce 10,000 yds 22A @ Kyser Pit
Team Elmers
Price: S 67,500.00
$6.75/yard
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Produce 2,000 yds 22A @ Thompson Pit

Team Elmers

Price: $ 17,500.00

$8.75/yard

Crush 1,200 yds concrete -Thompson Pit:

Team Elmers

Crushing concrete - 1,200 yards: S 16,800.00

$14.00/yard

Crush 900 yds asphalt -Thompson Pit:

Team Elmers

Crushing asphalt - 900 yards: S 10,800.00

$12.00/yard
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