
BENZIE COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 MATERIAL BID TABS  3/7/23

2021/2022

State Catch Basin Cleaning * Primary Awarded bid

 Greenscape  Rogue Instustrial  Kerbys Backhoe 

Catch basin cleaning - price is for 200+ each

Unit Price 62.00$               65.00$                  75.00$                  62.50$                

Total 12,400.00$       13,000.00$          15,000.00$          12,500.00$        

Emergency cleanout - 20 hours

Unit Price 235.00$             223.00$                295.00$               250.00$             

Total 4,700.00$          4,460.00$            5,900.00$            

County Catch Basin Cleaning * Primary

Catch basin cleaning - price is for 30  Greenscape  Rogue Instustrial  Kerbys Backhoe 

Unit Price  $               62.00  $               225.00  $                 95.00  $             250.00 

Total  $         1,860.00  $            6,750.00  $            2,850.00  $          7,500.00 

Emergency cleanout - Unknown

Unit Price 235.00$             250.00$                295.00$               275.00$             

Pavement Markings * Primary

PK Contracting

Mobilization (4 trips maximum) per trip: 100.00$             100.00$             

Waterborne paint: Early season Yellow per foot: 0.058$               0.052$                

Waterborne paint: Early season White per foot: 0.055$               0.050$                

Waterborne paint: Late season Yellow per foot: 0.058$               0.052$                

Waterborne paint: Late season White per foot: 0.055$               0.050$                

Thermoplastic rumble strips - per lineal foot 8.00$                 7.50$                  

Thermoplastic snowmobile crossing - per square ft 8.00$                 7.50$                  

Brine * Primary
 Liquid Calcium 

Chloride  G-L Chloride 

 Michigan 

Chloride Sales 

38% Calcium Chloride 0.792$               0.673$                  No bid $0.58/gallon

Per mile (1,900 gallons) 1,505.00$          1,278.70$            No bid 1,102.00$          

38% Calcium Chloride 0.792$               0.673$                  No bid

Per mile (2,500 gallons) 1,980.00$          1,682.50$            No bid 1,450.00$          

Alternate bids

32% winter - into storage in Honor Pit (Per gallon) 0.645$               0.593$                  No bid 0.505$                

Alternative winter-storage Honor Pit (Per gallon)

-  32% calcium chloride with BOOST 1.29$                    

- 26% mineral well brine for winter: 0.27$                    

9,000 gal min 7,000 gal min 9,500 gal min

 * Staff recommendation to Board for acceptance.
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